

**BID MATRIX SHEET  
TEMPORARY/RELIEF  
NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)  
RFP #09341**

**Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012**

			The Healing Staff 2534 State St., Ste 311 San Diego, CA 92101	Lead Staffing Corporation 216 S. Citrus St., #397 W. Covina, CA 91791	Registry Network, Inc. 1207 Carlsbad Village Drive, Ste. X Carlsbad, CA 92008	MGA Healthcare, Inc. 2143 Hurley Wy, #221 Sacramento, CA 95825	HRN Services Inc. 8383 Willshire Blvd. Ste. 258 Beverly Hills, CA 90211	Century Health Staffing Services, Inc. 1701 Westwind Dr. Bakersfield, CA 93301	Onward Healthcare, Inc. 64 Danbury Road Wilton, CT 06897	CHG Medical Staffing, Inc. dba RN Network 2000 NW Corporate Blvd, Ste 150, Boca Raton, FL 33431	R.L. Klein & Associates 3553 Atlantic Ave. Ste A-314 Long Beach, CA 90807	Advanced Medical Personnel, Inc. 10 Mountain View Ave. Bay Point, CA 94565	Drug Consultants 6715 N. Palm Ave. Ste. 101 Fresno, CA 93704
			(619) 516-8161	(800) 928-5561	(800) 400-1145	(714) 647-0300	(323) 951-1450	(661) 322-0606	(800) 278-0332x3150	(888) 200-9949	(562) 427-5577	(925) 458-4980	(559) 438-6500
			Fax Number	(877) 858-6263	(925) 438-2161	(714) 647-0301	Fax Number	(661) 322-0686	(800) 970-5001	(801) 930-4509	0	(925) 261-9950	(951) 231-2428
			Large 1% 10-00994	Small 0.65% 10-01024	Large 1% 10-01034	Large 0% 10-01031	Large 1% 10-00984	Large 1% 10-01040	Large 0.50% 10-01035	Large 0% 10-00987	Small 0.50% 10-00989	Large 0% 10-00991	Large 0.50% 10-00990
1. PBSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$26.22	\$23.95							\$20.00	\$26.29	\$23.00
	Rank		23	14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5	25	13
2. CCC, HDSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.99	\$23.95							\$20.00		\$23.00
	Rank		9	17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7	No Bid	15
3. DVI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.10	\$22.25	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00		\$18.80
	Rank		12	15	27	19	28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	7
4. MC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$26.27	\$21.95		\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00	\$26.29	\$19.80
	Rank		30	15	No Bid	19	28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7	31	8
5. SCC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.12	\$23.65			\$26.00				\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		12	19	No Bid	No Bid	26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7	No Bid	8
6. CMF, SOL	Hourly	\$26.29	\$24.03	\$21.55	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00	\$26.29	\$19.80
	Rank		26	13	30	19	29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6	33	7
7. FSP, SAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$25.53	\$22.95	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00	\$26.29	\$19.80
	Rank		28	20	29	18	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6	33	7
8. SQ	Hourly	\$26.29	\$24.22	\$21.95	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00	\$26.29	\$19.80
	Rank		24	13	28	16	29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4	33	5
9. CCWF, VSPW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.79	\$21.85		\$22.00					\$20.00		\$18.80
	Rank		18	17	No Bid	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	7
10. CTF, SVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$24.48	\$23.75			\$26.00				\$20.00	\$26.29	\$19.80
	Rank		23	19	No Bid	No Bid	28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	7	30	8
11. ASP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.44	\$21.95		\$22.00		\$25.00			\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		13	17	No Bid	19	No Bid	29	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	9
12. PVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.72	\$22.75		\$22.00					\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		12	18	No Bid	19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	9
13. COR, CSA	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.75	\$21.55		\$22.00					\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		9	17	No Bid	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	10
14. NKSP, KVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.49	\$22.79		\$22.00		\$25.00			\$20.00		
	Rank		9	20	No Bid	19	No Bid	28	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	7
15. WSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.53	\$22.75		\$22.00		\$25.00			\$20.00		\$18.80
	Rank		8	20	No Bid	19	No Bid	29	No Bid	No Bid	9	No Bid	7
16. CCI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.81	\$21.75		\$22.00		\$25.00			\$20.00	\$26.29	\$19.80
	Rank		10	14	No Bid	21	No Bid	28	No Bid	No Bid	7	33	9
17. LAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$22.70	\$20.99	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00	\$25.00			\$20.00		\$18.80
	Rank		21	13	33	18	32	28	No Bid	No Bid	9	No Bid	7
18. CMC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.33	\$21.95		\$22.00					\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		21	13	No Bid	16	No bid	No bid	No Bid	No Bid	6	No Bid	8
19. CIM, CIW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.52	\$20.95	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00		\$17.50
	Rank		18	14	33	22	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11	No Bid	7
20. CRC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.01	\$21.75	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$26.00				\$20.00		\$17.50
	Rank		17	15	32	22	33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11	No Bid	7
21. CAL, CEN	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.15	\$23.49	\$26.00	\$22.00					\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		11	17	27	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	9
22. CVSP, ISP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.91	\$23.95		\$22.00					\$20.00		\$19.80
	Rank		11	18	No Bid	15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	9
23. RJD	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.08	\$21.95	\$26.00	\$22.00					\$20.00		\$19.80

**BID MATRIX SHEET**  
**TEMPORARY/RELIEF**  
**NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)**  
**RFP #09341**  
**Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012**

	Rank		15	16	31	21	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8	No Bid	9
<b>Total Institution Groups Awarded</b>			23	23	9	19	10	5	0	0	23	7	23

**BID MATRIX SHEET  
 TEMPORARY/RELIEF  
 NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)  
 RFP #09341**

**Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012**

			Guardian Healthcare Providers 545 Mainstream Dr. Ste 402 Nashville, TN 37228 (615) 564-2983 (615) 564-2987	Westways Staffing Services, Inc. 2050 W. Chapman Ave Ste. 122, Orange, CA 92868 (714) 712-4150 (714) 712-4155	Mediscan Nursing Staffing, Inc. 21050 Califa St, Ste 100 Woodland Hills, CA 91367 (818) 758-8680 (818) 758-9541	SOS Nurses On-Call, Inc. 1091 N. Palm Canyon Palm Springs, CA (760) 322-9045 (760) 327-6765	Tech Group, Inc. 1101 N. Argonne Ste 203 Spokane Valley, WA 99212 (509) 688-3000 (509) 688-3001	Tempus LLC, dba Emerald Health Services 4640 Admiralty Way, Ste 201 Marina Del Rey, CA 90292 (800) 917-5055 (866) 917-5055	Readylink Healthcare 72030 Metroplex Dr. Thousand Palms, CA (760) 343-7000 (877) 428-6896	Associated Health Professionals, Inc. 6095 Bristol Parkway Culvar City, CA 90230 (800) 451-4454 (310) 645-3034	Maxim Healthcare Svcs, Inc. dba Maxim Staffing Solutions 104 Traffic Way, Suite A Arroyo Grande, CA 93420 (866) 250-8915	Nurses Internet Staffing Services, Inc. 6055 E. Washington. Commerce, CA 90040 (323) 720-9900 (323) 720-9903	
			Large	Large	Large	Large	Large	Large	Large	Large	Large	Large	Small
			Discount	0.75%	1.50%	0%	0%	0%	0%	2%	0%	0%	0%
			10-00995	10-00982	10-00988	10-00992	10-00996	10-01015	10-01016	10-01077	10-01026	10-01017	
1. PBSP	Hourly	\$26.29			\$22.50	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$24.00	\$22.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	11	15	9	No Bid	8	19	12	No Bid	
2. CCC, HDSP	Hourly	\$26.29			\$24.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$21.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	21	18	11	No Bid	10	16	13	No Bid	
3. DVI	Hourly	\$26.29			\$23.00	\$24.00	\$23.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$19.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	21	24	22	No Bid	14	23	9	No Bid	
4. MC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$19.89		
	Rank		23	No Bid	21	24	14	No Bid	13	22	9	No Bid	
5. SCC	Hourly	\$26.29			\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$19.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	20	22	16	No Bid	15	21	9	No Bid	
6. CMF, SOL	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$24.00	\$24.00	\$22.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$17.89		
	Rank		22	No Bid	25	24	18	No Bid	11	21	3	No Bid	
7. FSP, SAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$24.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$19.89		
	Rank		22	No Bid	25	24	15	No Bid	12	21	4	No Bid	
8. SQ	Hourly	\$26.29	\$26.24		\$24.00	\$24.00	\$24.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$20.89		
	Rank		31	No Bid	22	20	15	No Bid	9	19	7	No Bid	
9. CCWF, VSPW	Hourly	\$26.29			\$24.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$18.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	25	24	16	No Bid	15	22	8	No Bid	
10. CTF, SVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$24.00	\$24.00	\$23.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$24.89		
	Rank		18	No Bid	22	20	17	No Bid	13	16	24	No Bid	
11. ASP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$24.00	\$24.00	\$23.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$18.89	\$24.95	
	Rank		22	No Bid	26	24	21	No Bid	15	20	7	27	
12. PVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$24.00	\$24.00	\$23.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$18.89		
	Rank		23	No Bid	26	24	21	No Bid	14	22	7	No Bid	
13. COR, CSA	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$23.50	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$18.89	\$24.95	
	Rank		23	30	24	26	16	No Bid	15	22	7	27	
14. NKSP, KVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$19.89	\$24.95	
	Rank		24	31	22	25	15	No Bid	14	23	10	27	
15. WSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$19.89	\$24.95	
	Rank		24	32	22	26	16	No Bid	14	23	10	27	
16. CCI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.50	\$18.89		
	Rank		23	31	20	24	17	No Bid	16	26	5	No Bid	
17. LAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$22.00	\$24.00	\$22.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$18.89		
	Rank		23	34	17	24	19	No Bid	15	22	8	No Bid	
18. CMC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02		\$25.00	\$24.00	\$23.00		\$21.00	\$23.50	\$21.89		
	Rank		19	No Bid	25	20	18	No Bid	12	23	15	No Bid	
19. CIM, CIW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$21.50	\$24.00	\$22.00		\$21.00	\$23.50	\$17.89	\$24.95	
	Rank		24	34	17	27	21	No Bid	16	26	8	28	
20. CRC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$21.50	\$24.00	\$22.00		\$21.00	\$23.50	\$17.89	\$24.95	
	Rank		24	34	18	25	23	No Bid	16	27	8	28	
21. CAL, CEN	Hourly	\$26.29			\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$24.00	\$18.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	18	19	14	No Bid	13	22	7	No Bid	
22. CVSP, ISP	Hourly	\$26.29			\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.00		\$21.00	\$23.00	\$18.89		
	Rank		No Bid	No Bid	16	20	13	No Bid	12	17	7	No Bid	
23. RJD	Hourly	\$26.29	\$23.02	\$26.00	\$23.00	\$24.00	\$21.50		\$21.00	\$24.00	\$18.89		

**BID MATRIX SHEET**  
**TEMPORARY/RELIEF**  
**NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)**  
**RFP #09341**  
**Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012**

	Rank		24	32	23	25	17	No Bid	14	27	7	No Bid
<b>Total Institution Groups Awarded</b>			16	8	23	23	23	0	23	23	23	6

**BID MATRIX SHEET  
TEMPORARY/RELIEF  
NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)  
RFP #09341**

**Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012**

			Healthcare Services Company, Inc. 620 S. Glendora Ave. Glendora, CA 91740 (626) 335-1318 (626) 335-1554 Small 0.50% 10-01030	Professional Resource Interprises, Inc. 3731 Wilshire Blvd., Ste 630 Los Angeles, CA 90010 (213) 249-9150 (213) 249-9147 Large 1% 10-01018	Wesley Medical Staffing (CA), LLC 3111 Camino del Rio San Diego, CA 92108 (866) 369-5075 (888) 770-4859 Large 0% 10-01022	Preferred Staffing, Inc. 1090 Adams St, Ste H Benicia, CA 94510 (800) 638-9798 (707) 748-0404 Small 0.50% 10-01003	Career Staff Unlimited, Inc. 5180 N. Palm Ave. Fresno, CA 93704 (559) 244-0394 (559) 244-0425 Large 0.50% 10-01004	National Medical Registry, Inc., dba Solvere 901 Calle Amanecer, Ste 300 San Clemente, Ca 92673 (800) 451-7811 (888) 777-2067 Large 0.50% 10-01022	Just In Time Staffing, Inc. 5984 S. Prince St, Ste 200 Littleton, CO 80120 (877) 741-1118 (877) 781-8433 Large 0% 10-01023	MedStaff, Inc. 3805 W. Chester Pike Ste. 200, Newton Square, PA 19073 (800) 732-9992 (610) 353-7850 Large 1% 10-01025	Premier Healthcare Services, LLC 707 Wilshire Blvd. Los Angeles, CA 90017 (213) 327-1177 (310) 878-6786 Large 1.50% 10-01033	UNADI, Inc. 4345 E. Lowell Ste A Ontario, CA 91761 (909) 937-0296 (909) 937-0297 Large 1% 10-01028	Medical Staffing Network, Inc. 906 Yamato Rd., Ste 110 Boca Raton, FL 33431 (888) 966-5062, x17 (626) 732-2294 Large 1.00% 10-01041
1. PBSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$20.17		\$24.95	\$17.99	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$19.97	\$18.00	\$18.35	
	Rank		6	No Bid	No Bid	20	1	16	10	No Bid	7	2	3
2. CCC, HDSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37	\$25.06	\$17.49	\$17.99	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$26.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	23	No Bid	2	4	20	12	24	8	3	5
3. DVI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37	\$26.25	\$19.18	\$15.98	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$22.75	\$19.97	\$16.00	\$18.35
	Rank		4	No Bid	30	6	1	25	17	20	10	2	5
4. MC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37	\$25.06	\$18.74	\$16.78	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$21.50	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		2	27	No Bid	5	3	25	18	17	10	4	6
5. SCC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37		\$19.24	\$16.78	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$21.50	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		2	No Bid	No Bid	6	3	23	18	17	10	4	5
6. CMF, SOL	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.72	\$25.06	\$26.25	\$22.18	\$17.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$22.00	\$19.97	\$16.50	\$18.35
	Rank		14	28	32	16	2	23	15	17	8	1	4
7. FSP, SAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.72	\$25.06	\$26.25	\$20.92	\$17.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.00	\$19.97	\$16.50	\$18.35
	Rank		16	27	32	10	2	23	17	13	8	1	3
8. SQ	Hourly	\$26.29	\$21.72	\$25.06	\$26.25	\$22.87	\$19.99	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$24.00	\$20.97	\$18.00	\$18.35
	Rank		12	27	32	17	6	21	14	23	8	1	2
9. CCWF, VSPW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$17.24	\$16.59	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$19.00	\$19.97	\$15.50	\$18.35
	Rank		3	27	No Bid	5	4	23	19	9	11	1	6
10. CTF, SVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37	\$25.06	\$19.91	\$17.99	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$20.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	26	No Bid	6	3	21	15	10	9	2	4
11. ASP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$17.47	\$15.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$21.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	31	No Bid	4	2	25	18	16	10	5	6
12. PVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$17.47	\$15.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$23.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	28	No Bid	4	2	25	17	20	10	5	6
13. COR, CSA	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$18.14	\$15.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$22.65	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		3	29	No Bid	5	1	25	18	21	11	4	6
14. NKSP, KVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$18.23	\$15.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$22.75	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		3	30	No Bid	5	1	26	17	21	11	4	6
15. WSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$17.79	\$15.89	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$22.75	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		3	31	No Bid	5	1	25	17	21	11	4	6
16. CCI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$22.38	\$16.99	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$23.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	30	No Bid	18	2	25	19	22	11	3	4
17. LAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67	\$25.06	\$25.49	\$23.18	\$18.18	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$16.50	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	30	31	20	5	25	16	3	10	4	6
18. CMC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37	\$25.06	\$20.36	\$17.95	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$23.90	\$19.97	\$16.50	\$18.35
	Rank		2	27	No Bid	7	3	22	14	24	9	1	4
19. CIM, CIW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.42	\$25.06	\$21.95	\$16.58	\$16.95	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$17.50	\$19.97	\$15.50	\$18.35
	Rank		3	31	20	4	5	25	19	6	12	1	10
20. CRC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.42	\$25.06	\$21.95	\$16.69	\$16.95	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$17.00	\$19.97	\$15.50	\$18.35
	Rank		2	31	20	3	5	26	19	6	12	1	10
21. CAL, CEN	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.42		\$17.12	\$16.95	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$26.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	No Bid	No Bid	3	4	20	15	26	10	5	6
22. CVSP, ISP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.67		\$17.24	\$16.95	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$21.80	\$24.00	\$19.97	\$17.00	\$18.35
	Rank		1	No Bid	No Bid	3	4	21	14	22	10	5	6
23. RJD	Hourly	\$26.29	\$17.37	\$25.06	\$21.95	\$17.96	\$18.18	\$23.50	\$21.80	\$20.00	\$19.97	\$18.00	\$18.35

**BID MATRIX SHEET**  
**TEMPORARY/RELIEF**  
**NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)**  
**RFP #09341**

Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012

	Rank		2	30	19	3	5	26	18	11	10	4	6
<b>Total Institution Groups Awarded</b>			<b>23</b>	<b>18</b>	<b>8</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>22</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>23</b>

**BID MATRIX SHEET  
TEMPORARY/RELIEF  
NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)  
RFP #09341**

Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012

			SHC Services, Inc. dba Supplemental Health Care 1640 W. Redstone Center Park City, UT 84098	JayKay, Inc. 913 E. North St., Ste G Leesburg, FL 34748	Cambridge Healthcare 600 Jefferson Plaza Rockville, MD 20852	WG Hall, LLC 5940 Pacific Stockton, CA	Valley Healthcare Systems, Inc. 3721 Douglas Blvd. Roseville, CA 95661	All Health Services Corporation 10917 Goldsborough Oakdale, CA 95361	Simply the Best Healthcare Staffing 1585 South D St., #205 San Bernardino, CA 92408	Spectrum Services Group, Inc. 4620 Northgate Blvd. Sacramento, CA
			(800) 456-6677 (735) 645-0792	(800) 442-5441, x101 (800) 805-9016	(301) 838-3430 (310) 838-3063	(209) 956-4656 (209) 956-3860	(800) 953-0508 (916) 669-0510	(866) 506-0513 (866) 213-6883	(909) 380-7670 (909) 380-7676	(916) 760-7913 (916) 923-3336
			Large 0.50% 10-01029	Large \$5.00 10-01032	Large 0% 10-01063	Large 1% 10-01083	Large 0.50% 10-01053	Large 0% 10-01045	SB (Micro) 1% 10-01063	Small 0% 10-01042
1. PBSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$26.29	\$25.00		\$26.00	\$23.87		\$24.50
	Rank		4	24	21	No Bid	22	18	No Bid	17
2. CCC, HDSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$26.00	\$25.00		\$26.00	\$22.94		\$24.25
	Rank		6	26	22	No Bid	25	14	No Bid	19
3. DVI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$22.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.87		\$22.25
	Rank		3	18	26	11	29	13	No Bid	16
4. MC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$22.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.94		\$22.25
	Rank		1	20	26	11	29	12	No Bid	16
5. SCC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$24.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.94		\$21.25
	Rank		1	24	25	11	27	14	No Bid	13
6. CMF, SOL	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.94		\$22.97
	Rank		5	12	27	9	31	10	No Bid	20
7. FSP, SAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93		\$22.75
	Rank		5	14	26	9	31	11	No Bid	19
8. SQ	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$21.00	\$26.00	\$22.94		\$25.75
	Rank		3	11	25	10	30	18	No Bid	26
9. CCWF, VSPW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$19.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93		\$22.25
	Rank		2	12	26	13	28	14	No Bid	21
10. CTF, SVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93		\$26.25
	Rank		5	14	25	11	29	12	No Bid	27
11. ASP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$19.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93	\$25.00	\$23.95
	Rank		3	11	30	12	32	14	28	23
12. PVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.92		\$22.25
	Rank		3	15	27	11	29	13	No Bid	16
13. COR, CSA	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$19.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.23		\$22.25
	Rank		2	12	28	13	31	14	No Bid	19
14. NKSP, KVSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93		\$22.55
	Rank		2	16	29	12	32	13	No Bid	18
15. WSP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$21.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.94	\$25.00	\$22.25
	Rank		2	15	30	12	33	13	28	18
16. CCI	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$19.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93	\$25.00	\$20.45
	Rank		6	12	29	13	32	15	27	8
17. LAC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$19.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.93	\$25.00	\$24.75
	Rank		2	11	29	12	35	14	27	26
18. CMC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$19.00	\$25.49	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.12		\$23.75
	Rank		5	28	26	10	29	11	No Bid	17
19. CIM, CIW	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$17.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.87	\$25.00	\$22.95
	Rank		2	9	30	13	35	15	29	23
20. CRC	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$17.99	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.91	\$25.00	\$22.75
	Rank		4	9	30	13	35	14	29	21
21. CAL, CEN	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$24.00	\$25.00		\$26.00	\$20.88	\$25.00	\$26.15
	Rank		2	21	24	No Bid	28	12	23	25
22. CVSP, ISP	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$24.49	\$25.00		\$26.00	\$23.18	\$25.00	\$26.15
	Rank		2	24	25	No Bid	27	19	23	26
23. RJD	Hourly	\$26.29	\$16.00	\$22.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$20.88	\$25.00	\$23.25

**BID MATRIX SHEET**  
**TEMPORARY/RELIEF**  
**NURSING SERVICES (RN/LVN/CNA)**  
**RFP #09341**  
**Term: June 15, 2010 through June 30, 2012**

	Rank		1	20	29	12	33	13	28	22
<b>Total Institution Groups Awarded</b>			23	23	23	19	23	23	9	23